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  Giving your children the gift of bilingualism can enrich their life.
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In a world that is becoming increasingly 
globalized and diverse, the ability to speak more 
than one language may be a desirable trait, 
especially because bilingualism confers social, 
economic, and intellectual advantages. Eighty 
percent of Americans believe that children should 
learn a second language fluently before 
graduating from high school. If you share this 
sentiment of wanting to raise a bilingual child, 
here are seven evidence-based suggestions on 
how to promote successful dual language 
acquisition in children. While some of these 
strategies are most applicable to bilingual 
households, others will be useful even if you 
don’t speak another language yourself. 

1. Increase language quantity. 
The quantity of linguistic input children receive in 
each of their languages predicts vocabulary and 
grammatical development. The richer the input, 
the higher the likelihood of successful language 
acquisition. For example, children who hear a lot 
of words have a larger vocabulary size. Do not 

underestimate the power of consistently exposing 
your child to two languages. 

2. Increase language quality. 
Quality of linguistic input also influences 
children’s language outcomes. Having stimulating 
face-to-face interactions with caregivers is crucial 
in helping children acquire language. For 
example, reading books to children supports 
language development, whereas language 
exposure via television does not. Low-quality 
television exposure has actually been associated 
with lower vocabulary scores in bilingual 
children. In other words, aim for more face time 
and choose educational or high-quality children’s 
television when possible. 

3. Enlist the help of family and friends. 
Variability in language input is another key 
predictor of language growth. Having regular 
interactions with many different speakers of the 
two languages can help boost bilingual 
proficiency, as children are exposed to more 
diversity. In other words, having interactions with 
extended family members, grandparents, and 
friends who speak the other language provides 
further benefit for children’s development.  

4. Select a strategy that works best for your 
family. 
There are many different ways to expose your 
child to two languages, depending on the 
household. Although no single approach has been 
identified as the best for raising bilingual 
children, several have been found to support 
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bilingual language development. For example, 
there is the “one person one language” approach, 
commonly used by two parents who speak 
different languages (e.g., Parent A speaks one 
language, Parent B speaks another language). In 
another common approach, a child is exposed to 
one language (typically a minority language, 
sometimes referred to as a heritage language) in 
the home and a second language (typically the 
majority language) in school. A different strategy 
could be to speak to your child in a different 
language each day of the week. You can also 
develop your own strategy -- for example, some 
parents have reported that if a child has watched 
Frozen a million times and knows every line by 
heart, having her watch it in Spanish next time 
may result in her picking up Spanish vocabulary 
along the way. 

5. Consider bilingual education.  
During early development, there may be an option 
of providing bilingual child care by using 
babysitters or caregivers who speak another 
language. 

Once your child is of school age, consider schools 
with two-way immersion programs, which 
include students of two different native languages 
in the same classroom and teach content classes in 
those two languages. In addition to providing 
children with consistent exposure to two 
languages across subject areas, which increases 
the likelihood of the students achieving 
proficiency in both languages, our research shows 
that two-way immersion programs also promote 
students’ academic achievements. 

If two-way immersion programs are not available 
in your school district, there may be other 
alternatives. Afterschool or weekend language 
lessons also provide a formal instructional setting 
that can promote second language acquisition. 
Places of worship can also be useful resources if 
you are trying to raise your child to speak a 

language that is associated with your faith.  

6. Let your child lead the way. 
Pay attention to cues from your child and follow 
their interests. Language development is most 
successful when children interact with attentive 
and sensitive adults. A child is more likely to 
learn new words when an adult focuses on objects 
that the child is interested in as opposed to what 
the adult is interested in. Your child will have a 
higher chance of success acquiring two languages 
if they are engaged. To encourage learning, try to 
find activities involving two languages that 
interest your child. 

7. Continue educating yourself about bilingual 
language development.  
Learn more about bilingualism yourself. There are 
numerous misconceptions surrounding raising a 
bilingual child. For example, there are beliefs that 
bilingualism leads to language disorders and 
learning disabilities or that bilingual children are 
confused by hearing more than one language. 
However, these myths have been debunked. 
Bilingual children actually achieve important 
language milestones at the same rate as 
monolingual children. Good starting points on 
this topic include resources shared by the 
Bilingualism Matters Center and books such as A 
Parents’ and Teachers’ Guide to Bilingualism and 
The Bilingual Family: A Handbook for Parents. 

Final thoughts 
Although there are no universal rules to follow 
when it comes to raising a bilingual child, the 
most important thing to do as a parent is to 
provide nurturing support. The approach that you 
end up taking will depend on the nature of your 
household, the area you live in, and the resources 
that are available to you. At the end of the day, 
focus on raising a happy child. The ability to 
speak two languages and the cognitive, 
neurological, and social benefits that come with it 
are an additional bonus.
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